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are doctrines of truth, of holiness, of
progress and advancement, designed to
save men, to build them up, to de-
velop the best thoughts in them, and
prepare them for greater light and
greater knowledge and understanding
than dawned upon mankind in ages
past; to prepare a people by their in-
telligence, by their fully developed char-
acters, for that glorious day when the
Son of God shall come among them and
dwell with them. It is true that it is im-
possible for the Christian world to har-
monize many of the doctrines that are
growing in favor with them today with
the holy Scriptures, and for that reason
the Latter-day Saints mourn that their
brethren and sisters of the world, though
professing Christianity, should be averse
to receiving the principles of Christian-
ity as they were revealed by the Savior
Himself. Today with all the Christian-
ity that prevails in the world, where do
you find men who are willing to receive
the very first, the fundamental princi-
ples of the doctrine of Christ? Where
are those who will receive the ministry
of such as conveyed Christian principles
in the meridian of time to the under-
standing of men? What! The adminis-
tration of angels in our day and age of
the world? A greater absurdity could
not be proposed. What! Faith as the
first principle of salvation? No, reason
is the first principle of salvation in the
day and age in which we live. But it is
not so written in the doctrine of Christ.
"Believe and thou shalt be saved," is the
doctrine of the Savior. It is belief, it
is faith, that underlies that knowledge
which secures mankind an entrance into
the Kingdom of God. We teach and
have been taught that we must have
faith in the Lord Jesus Christ: that we
must believe in the words of truth that

have been revealed from Him; that we
must put our trust in God who has de-
livered His people in times that are past
and gone; that we must rely upon His
direction and walk in the path that He
shall lead us in, fearing only Him, fear-
ing not man who can destroy the body
but fearing God who can destroy both
body and soul. In our endeavor to keep
the commandments of God, to practice
them, to heed the teachings of angels
sent from the throne of grace, to put
away our sins, to live pure lives, holy and
righteous in the sight of God and our fel-
low men, to enter into sacred places and
administer the ordinances of everlasting
life for ourselves and for our dead—in
endeavoring to do these things we have
incurred the displeasure of an unbeliev-
ing world, of those who have substituted
something else as the first principles of
life and salvation for those which were
given 1,800 years ago by the Savior of
the world. The world has assumed to sit
in judgment upon us for this belief. The
world has assumed to say that we have
done wrong in accepting these truths
and living according to the law which
God has revealed for our guidance and
our government. Now, for one I do not
believe that the judgment, in this re-
spect, of the world will materially af-
fect us in practicing and carrying out
the purposes of Jehovah. Certainly it
cannot change the truth. If Mormonism
is truth the adverse criticism and judg-
ment of mankind cannot materially af-
fect its practice. They certainly can-
not stand against that power which ever
accompanies the promulgation of truth.
Because of this Latter-day Saints have
no fears of the future. We are daunt-
less in our advocacy of these principles
because we know that they are true and
must therefore prevail.


