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bably an average one of the people of this
Territory, you would instantly say, that
there does not appear to be much differ-
ence in the appearance of the people here
and the average congregations of wor-
shippers elsewhere. The facts are that
the people here—the older ones at all
events—have been called and gathered
from among mankind, and from Chris-
tendom, as a rule. There are in this
Church many native-born citizens, who
have come from every State of the Amer-
ican Union, and are fully acquainted
with all its religious sects and creeds.
There are those who have come from
the different nations of Europe, and they
have been familiar with the institutions
which exist there; they have attended
the services and been identified with the
same organizations that you find today.
They know all about the churches and
the ministers and the Sabbath schools
and the literature of the religious world.
They have analyzed and compared and
contrasted these until they understand
not only the differences that exist be-
tween the several churches, individu-
ally, as they are known in Christendom,
but they understand also the vast differ-
ences between those churches and that
record called the Bible. They have been
familiar with that, including the New
Testament, from their childhood. They
were taught it of their mothers and their
fathers. They read it in the Sabbath
school. They listened to the exposition of
its truths and doctrines in the churches
to which they belonged, and it was
personal mental analysis and compari-
son that gave conviction to their souls
and induced them to receive that order
which the world has designated "Mor-
monism." As a rule the people of Utah
are "Mormons," from conviction and

from choice. They have left the institu-
tions of their fathers because of the de-
fects which were discovered therein, be-
cause of the inconsistencies which pre-
vailed there, and in thousands of in-
stances have reached conclusions be-
cause of the teachings that many of them
received in the religious organizations of
the world. The Latter-day Saints, to the
surprise of many, call themselves Chris-
tians. Notwithstanding the opposition
that they have encountered; notwith-
standing the prejudice with which they
have had to contend; notwithstanding
the ignorance that is everywhere man-
ifest in regard to them and to their in-
stitutions, they claim to be Christians—
or followers of Christ; and in assum-
ing this title, they accept it with all
that it implies. They defend with as
much devotion and persistence the char-
acter and institutions and teachings that
were given of their Lord and Savior as
recorded in the Books that have been
handed down from the fathers as do the
disciples of any system, either secular
or religious, who follow out the dictates,
theories and ideas of those whom they
have accepted as their leaders. The fol-
lowers of John Wesley are no more tena-
cious of the teachings of their illustrious
predecessor, the founder of their church,
than are the Latter-day Saints in regard
to the teachings of the Savior, and of
His servant the Prophet Joseph Smith.
Those who revere the name of Wash-
ington and of the fathers of this repub-
lic, and because of that reverence, cher-
ish the fundamental truths of the Con-
stitution, and the Declaration of Inde-
pendence, are no more tenacious of the
truths uttered by those whom they ac-
cept as leaders, than are the Latter-
day Saints in regard to the teachings
and ordinances as established by Christ.


