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and that the peace of heaven may
be and abide in all our hearts,

which I ask in the name of Jesus. Amen.

SLAIN FOR THE TESTIMONY OF JESUS—FUNERAL RITES
OF JOSEPH STANDING.

DISCOURSE BY PRESIDENT JOHN TAYLOR, DELIVERED IN THE TABERNACLE, SALT LAKE

CITY, SUNDAY MORNING, AUG. 3, 1879.

REPORTED BY GEO. F. GIBBS.

I wish to make a very few remarks on
the present occasion; and I desire that
order and quietness may prevail.

We are met today on what may be
termed a very sorrowful occasion. We
see before us the body of a murdered
man, cut off in the bloom and flower of
his youth, with brilliant prospects before
him of a useful and glorious future. It is
sorrowful to reflect that men in a land of
liberty, a land that boasts of its enlight-
enment, its religious liberty and its lib-
eral institutions, should be guilty of im-
bruing their hands in the blood of an up-
right honorable man because he dared to
worship God according to the dictates of
his own conscience and to teach his fel-
low man the ways of life. It is a sorrow-
ful reflection to feel that liberty is only a
name and that protection and even equal

rights, is only a figment, an exploded
theory; and we may say, how has the
glory of this nation become sullied! How
has the fine gold become dim! How have
the high and noble principles that in-
spired the founders of this nation, in
whose breasts burned the spirit of free-
dom been desecrated, and those glori-
ous principles for which they battled
been trailed in the dust. And what a
miserable showing we have before us
of the efficacy of those sacred princi-
ples for which the founders of those in-
stitutions battled and died. It is sor-
rowful to reflect upon it. And on the
other hand it is a matter of pride to
Latter-day Saints to see one of our youth
firm and unshaken in the principles of
our holy religion, and ready to main-
tain them in the midst of fanaticism and
hate even unto death. Pride, indeed


