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fathers to the children, and the heart of
the children to their fathers, lest I come
and smite the earth with a curse." Did
Elijah hold these particular keys of the
priesthood? He did. And did he confer
them upon Joseph Smith? Yes, he did.
An account of this too will be found in the
reference I have already given you. Did
the Latter-day Saints generally manifest
any particular desire to build Temples
before the prophet Elijah came? No; but
ever since this desire and feeling has
existed in the minds of the Latter-day
Saints. It might appear very foolish to
other people, but to us it is both consis-
tent and necessary. The first Temple we
built was in Kirtland, Ohio; the next was
in Nauvoo, Illinois, and a foundation of
a third was laid in Far West, Missouri.
Since our coming to Utah, we have built
one Temple in St. George and a beauti-
ful building it is; and in that Temple are
now performed ordinances for the living
and the dead. And let me ask, if any
present in this large assembly today re-
gret in the least having contributed to it.
I do not think for a moment that there is
a man or woman that does. We have al-
ready expended a large amount of means
on the Temple now being constructed in
Salt Lake City; and still we have com-
menced two other such buildings, one
in Manti and the other in Logan, all
of which will be magnificent buildings
when completed; I suppose there are not
less than five hundred men employed on
these buildings, in this Territory. It looks
odd and simple, the world does not know
what it means; but we know, for God has
revealed it to us; and he has not only re-
vealed it, but he has put it here (pointing
to the heart), and we cannot get rid of it.

In the year 1876, President Young

was strongly impressed with this feeling,
and he requested the Twelve to call upon
the High Priests and Seventies, and the
Elders to subscribe towards carrying for-
ward the Temple in this city. Was the
call responded to? Yes; the various quo-
rums throughout the length and breadth
of the Territory willingly contributed and
a very material advance has been made
in the construction of that building. Why
did President Young feel so? Because the
spirit of God rested upon him, prompting
him to move in this direction. Why did
the brethren of these several quorums
so readily respond to the call? Because
the same spirit rested upon them; and
hence we find that the First Presidency,
the Twelve, and the Saints generally, are
all interested in this movement, evincing
the same desire to accomplish this work
of Temple building, as the Saints of for-
eign lands do to gather to Zion. What
object have we in view in doing this?
That we may administer the ordinances
which the Lord has revealed unto us, and
which, according to his command, must
be done in Temples built to his name. If
we were to turn over today these build-
ings to the religious world, they would
know no more how to use them legiti-
mately, than a baby would know what
to do with algebra; neither would we
had not the Lord taught us by revelation
from heaven. The Gospel brings life and
immortality to light; it places us in com-
munion with the heavens, the Priesthood
there and the Priesthood here working
harmoniously together, we being taught
of them are enabled to accomplish what
the Lord requires of us.

We, as intelligent beings, made
in the image of our Creator, are
placed here upon the earth to ac-
complish a certain work, that we


