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every one that is called by my name."
Will it leave a Christian behind? Not
one. Go and search New York, Philadel-
phia, and all the eastern States, and the
middle and southern States, and then
all Europe, for a Christian after this
prophecy is fulfilled, and you can't find
one. Why? Because they are all gath-
ered in one. How? By new revelation.
The Lord says, "I will say to the north,

Give up." The Lord's going to speak, the
Lord is going to utter something—"I will
say to the south, Keep not back. I will
say, Come ye, my sons and daughters,
from the ends of the earth, even every
one that is called by my name." What an
awful condition the world will be in when
there is not a Christian among them.
Amen.
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"Who am I, saith the Lord, that I com-
mand and am not obeyed? Who am I,
saith the Lord, that I promise and do not
fulfill?" We have again the privilege of
assembling ourselves together upon an-
other Annual Conference of the Church
of Jesus Christ of Latter-day Saints, and
I hope and trust that, what time we may
spend in Conference, our hearts may be
lifted up unto the Lord, that his Holy
Spirit may be given unto us, that we may
be dictated and directed in our words,
thoughts, acts, and teachings, in such

a manner that we may be justified before
him.

We have said, time after time, and
year after year, that we live in a very
peculiar age, generation and dispensa-
tion, and this is true. Time rolls on,
carrying with it its events, and fulfill-
ing the revelations of God, unto us es-
pecially. We live in a day of darkness;
unbelief and infidelity are covering the
whole face of the earth, until it seems
as though the whole Christian world
had lost all hold of faith in God and in
his Son Jesus Christ, and in the Bible,


