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should reveal certain revelations? "Oh,
no," says one. Well, then, ought you
not to reject the prophecy of Jeremiah,
inasmuch as no Prophet preceding him
spoke of him, no one who lived before
him who said a word about his book
called the Book of Jeremiah? More-
over, were there no Prophets that proph-
esied concerning the coming of Ezekiel
and his book, and Hosea and his book,
and of Joel, Amos, Malachi, and many
of the ancient Prophets who might be
named? What preceding Prophet proph-
esied concerning the coming forth of
these books? None at all. The Jews
would have had the same right in the
days of these Prophets to say—"I will
reject you Jeremiah, and I will not re-
ceive your revelations, and my reasons
for rejecting you are that none of the
preceding Prophets have named you by
name, and they have not spoken of your
book." The Jews might have rejected the
whole catalogue of the Prophets on this
ground; therefore, this is another species
of evidence in favor of the Book of Mor-
mon, over and above that which can be
brought to establish the divinity of the
Bible.

What more might be said to prove the
divinity of the Book of Mormon? I will
bring up some other evidence besides all
that I have named. We are told in the
prophecies of the holy Prophets, not only
about the coming of the angel, but we
are told that when God should set up his
kingdom and send that angel, it should
be a dispensation of gathering the peo-
ple of God. Now, supposing that Joseph
Smith had all these proofs that I have
named to testify concerning the divinity
of this book, and had said nothing about
the gathering, what then? Why you and
I could go to our homes and say, "good-
bye Joseph Smith, we do not believe you
to be a Prophet." "Why?" "Because the

latter-day dispensation was to be charac-
terized by the gathering together of all
things in one that are in Christ, and you
have said nothing about it, and there-
fore we reject you." But is it so? No; be-
fore the rise of this Church, while Joseph
Smith was translating the Book of Mor-
mon, it is predicted here, in this trans-
lation, that the Church should go forth
from this continent to all the people, na-
tions and tongues of the earth, and that
all who believed should be gathered in
one. Now how did Joseph Smith know
that that would be fulfilled when there
was no Church in existence? It is a very
easy matter, as I said before, to proph-
esy, but to fulfill is another thing. But
here in Utah is the fulfillment, for here
are upwards of a hundred thousand peo-
ple gathered out from the nations of the
earth, proving definitely, at least so far
as this species of evidence is concerned,
that Joseph Smith certainly was a true
Prophet, for he predicted it before it com-
menced to take place.

There is another species of evidence
in this book. It is foretold within its
pages that after it should come forth in
the latter day and the Church should
have been established, the blood of
the Saints should cry from the ground
against their persecutors and those who
should slay them. This was a prophecy,
the fulfillment of which in an enlight-
ened age like this, seemed very un-
likely. We find that, since the organi-
zation of this free government, and our
great charter of liberties and constitu-
tion, since the time of the enunciation of
these choice republican principles upon
this continent by this great and powerful
nation, that the blood of no sects or par-
ties has, as it were, stained our ground
because of the belief of the people. Some-
times they get killed in mobs about anti-


