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holy ordinances, so God has commanded,
in these latter days, that there should be
a baptismal font, and the ordinance of
baptism for the dead must be performed
in the place that God designates, in order
to be legal and acceptable in his sight.

We are told in the revelations which
God has given, through his servant
Joseph Smith, something about the pat-
tern of this sacred and holy ordinance.
We are told that the living are not only
to be baptized for and in behalf of the
dead, by being immersed in water in
their respective names, but that they are
also to receive the ordinance of confir-
mation by the laying on of hands, not
for themselves, but for the dead, as far
back as they can trace them. Hundreds
of millions of people died before God gave
this revelation, in these latter times, and
they had not the opportunity of being
married for time and all eternity, no man
on the earth, in their day, having the
authority to unite them. Would you de-
prive them of the blessings of this eter-
nal union, because they did not happen
to live in a day when God revealed and
restored anew, from the heavens, these
ordinances? No. God is a consistent
being, and to say that people who die
in ignorance, without having an oppor-
tunity of attending to the ordinances of
the house of God, should not be made
partakers of the blessings thereof, would
be imputing injustice to the great Jeho-
vah. To say that our fathers and moth-
ers, who were only married for time,
must be deprived of a union in the
eternal worlds, because of their igno-
rance of these things, because there was
no person having authority to adminis-
ter to them, would be apparently un-
just, and would almost seem to impeach
the attributes of Jehovah, if we could
suppose such partiality was his design.

But we cannot suppose that God is an in-
consistent Being. And if we have the op-
portunity of attending to the ordinance
of marriage in the house of the Lord, and
of securing certain eternal blessings for
ourselves, our ancestors, who are dead,
must have a plan devised, adapted to
their condition, by which they also may
be exalted to the same blessings. But
it must be done by law. No haphaz-
ard work, no work of chance or con-
fusion, but everything must be accom-
plished by the laws, ordinances and com-
mandments of the Great Jehovah; then,
what is done by his servants here on the
earth, being sealed here is sealed in the
heavens, and hence, we not only keep a
record of all the names of the dead, but
of all the ordinances attended to for and
in their behalf; and in the great judg-
ment day, when the books are opened, it
will be found that such and such parties
have been baptized for, confirmed for,
and administered for, in the marriage
ordinance, and that these various ordi-
nances were recorded in the presence of
witnesses.

The records kept by authority here,
will agree with the records kept in
heaven, for they keep records there, as
well as we; and the books on earth,
when they are kept by divine authority,
will agree with the records in heaven.
When there is divine authority in the
administration of an ordinance here on
the earth, that ordinance is sacred and
holy, and is recorded here and in the
heavens, and the records of heaven will
agree with the records of earth; and by
these records and books will mankind
be judged. The dead will be judged ac-
cording to men in the flesh, or, in other
words, as we shall be judged according
to our works in the flesh. When we have
been baptized, and it is recorded on the


