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Austria, or Russia, or any king or poten-
tate on earth. If they were to say to me,
"You may go and preach your gospel in
our dominions, and we will see you pro-
vided for," I would rather trust in God
than in any of them. These are my feel-
ings and that is my experience. Why?
Because I might be in situations where
their munificence could not reach me,
but I could not be in a place where the
Lord God could not see me, for His eyes
are over all the earth, and His angels
will guard and His Spirit will comfort
and sustain His servant. That is why I
say cleave to Him and magnify your call-
ings. When you do not the Spirit will
be withdrawn from you, and you will be
weak indeed. In all my travels I never
wanted anything, and this is the expe-
rience of my brethren all around, who
have been engaged in the same work.
The Lord has always provided for us
while we were engaged in his work and
doing His will. And if the whole people
will cleave to Him, and be humble, faith-
ful, and united in keeping His command-
ments, the Spirit and power of God will
rest upon them, and their blessings will
be a thousand fold greater than they are
today.

Our strength is in God, and not in
our ourselves. Our wisdom and power
come from Him; they are not of our-
selves. We are the servants of God, and
to Him we have to look for guidance,
direction, and sustenance in all things,
and if we will only do that which He
requires of us as a people, there is no
promise that has been made, not a bless-
ing over pronounced, not a privilege ever
conferred upon any people under the
face of the whole heavens in our age of
the world but will be conferred upon us.

We are living in the dispensation of
the fulness of times, when God has com-
menced to gather together all things in
one. He has revealed to us His law, and
He is continuing to do so. It is for us to
learn to subject ourselves to that law, to
obey His commands, submit to His au-
thority, and pursue that course that we
can always have the approbation of the
Most High. Let us eschew evil, cleave to
that which is good, honor our God and
our religion, and the blessings of heaven
will rest upon and abide with us from
this time henceforth and forever. Zion
will arise and shine, the power of God
will be made manifest in our midst, and
no hand, nor any power that shall rise
against us, shall be able to injure or de-
stroy us.

In relation, again, to these elders, I
will tell you the first thing I used to
do when I went preaching, particularly
when I went to a fresh place—and that
was to go aside to some place, anywhere
I could get, into a field, a barn, into the
woods, or my closet, and ask God to bless
me and give me wisdom to meet all the
circumstances with which I might have
to contend; and the Lord gave me the
wisdom I needed and sustained me. If
you pursue a course of this kind He will
bless you also. Do not trust in your-
selves, but study the best books—the
Bible and Book of Mormon—and get all
the information you can, and then cleave
to God and keep yourselves free from cor-
ruption and pollution of every kind, and
the blessings of the Most High will be
with you; and if you go forth trembling
and in weakness, bearing precious seed,
you shall return rejoicing and bringing
your sheaves with you.

May God bless you, and all Israel, in
the name of Jesus. Amen.


