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entirely their own affair. There may be
written upon the whole world, religious
and political, "MENE, MENE, TEKEL,
UPHARSIN." (Thou art weighed in the
balances, and art found wanting.) What
is that to us? It is none of our affair. We
are not associated with them; our inter-
est is not bound up with them; they have
nothing which we can sustain. In rela-
tion to all these matters we feel perfectly
easy. If war goes forth and desolates the
nations; if confusion exist among reli-
gious denominations; and if they should
continue to act as they are doing, like
perfect fools, it is their own business.
The Pope may tremble on his throne,
and be afraid that France or some other
power will not sustain him; it is not our
affair; we feel perfectly easy and tran-
quil; all is right with us, for we are in
the hands of God, and it is his business
to take care of his Saints; therefore, we
feel perfectly easy, quiet, and peaceable
in relation to all these matters.

Would they try to injure us? Yes.
They never tried anything else, and we
are not indebted to them for anything
which we enjoy. Did any of them help
us along in our religious matters? Who
are we indebted to in this world? Is
there a religious society under the heav-
ens that we are indebted to for any ideas
or intelligence which we possess? Not
one. Is there any priest in Christen-
dom that has helped us forward in the
least in our religious career? Not one.
You cannot find one. Are we indebted
to anybody for our political status? We
are not. Who is there that helps us?
There has never been a man yet who
dared, at any time, to advocate our prin-
ciples and rights in the legislative halls
of this or any other nation; there has
never been a man who has had the hon-
esty, and truthfulness, and integrity to
do it; they dare not do it, because it is
unpopular. We dare advocate our prin-

ciples, and God dare help us; and if
we enjoy any rights, and privileges, and
peace—if there are any blessings of any
kind that we enjoy—we derive them
from our Heavenly Father, and we are
not indebted to any power, government,
rule, or authority, religious, political, or
otherwise, throughout the whole of this
habitable globe, for any blessings or priv-
ileges we enjoy, excepting sometimes, by
a little persecution they help us to be a
little more united, that's all; and we do
not thank them for this, for it does not
come with their good will. If their lies
shall make the truth of God abound to
his glory, all right; they will lie on, be-
cause they are of their father the devil,
and his work they will do. He was a liar
from the beginning; he is the father of
lies, and they are his children. There-
fore, in relation to all of these matters
we feel perfectly easy.

I was asked the other day if I would
like to go and bear testimony before the
court in relation to whether polygamy
was a religious ordinance or not. I an-
swered yes, if they subpoena me. They
have not done it yet, and I do not know
whether they will or not. I am quite will-
ing to go and testify to that matter at
any time. I think I will testify to you
here. To begin with, there is nothing that
I know of, or am acquainted with in this
world, but what is a part of my religion
and mixed up with it. It is all religion
with me. I was told that the parties de-
sired to know whether or not I believed
that polygamy was a religious ordinance
or institution. If this question had been
put to me, I should have been inclined
to ask the parties what they understood
by the word religion; because, if I could
not find out what their view of religion
was, of course I could not tell whether I,
in their estimation, had any or not.

This consideration led me to a few
reflections in relation to this matter.


