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prehend the duration of time? To return
to our friends after an absence of some
time and greet them with a glad heart,
to mingle our mutual joy, happiness and
congratulations, is one of the sweetest
phases of human bliss, and were we told
that there never would be a time when
this heaven of happiness cannot be en-
joyed, we could partially understand it;
we only understand it so far as we are
capable of appreciating the comingling
of kindred joys at the reunion of parted
friends. The present is that portion of
time that more particularly concerns us,
and the greatest and most important la-
bor we have to perform is to cultivate
ourselves. That man may know his fel-
low creatures, it is necessary that he
should first know himself. When he thor-
oughly knows himself, he measurably
knows God, whom to know is eternal life.

We have been hearing that Jesus
Christ is our elder Brother. Yes, he is
one of us, flesh of our flesh, bone of our
bone, and became a partaker with us of
all that is earthly. He also inherited a
greater portion of the divine nature than
we can possess in this life. He was the
Son of our heavenly Father, as we are the
sons of our earthly fathers. God is the
Father of our spirits, which are clothed
upon by fleshly bodies, begotten for us
by our earthly fathers. Jesus is our el-
der Brother spirit clothed upon with an
earthly body begotten by the Father of
our spirits.

Our heavenly Father delights in his
good children, he delights continually to
bless them, yea, "He maketh his sun to
rise on the evil and on the good, and
sendeth rain on the just and on the un-
just." All are equally his children. We
are all the children of our common Fa-
ther, who has placed us on the earth to
prove ourselves, to govern, control, ed-
ucate and sanctify ourselves, body and
spirit, unto him, according to his will

and pleasure. When all that class of
spirits designed to take bodies upon this
earth have done so, then will come the
winding-up scene of this particular de-
partment of the works of God on this
earth. It is his will that we should pre-
pare ourselves to build up his kingdom,
gather the house of Israel, redeem and
build up Zion and Jerusalem, revolution-
ize the world, and bring back that which
has been lost through the fall.

The inhabitants of the earth are ig-
norant of the way to secure their present
and future happiness, but, if we are
faithful, we shall see the time when
we can speak to the understandings of
the people. It is now very difficult
to do that. Their minds are closed
against every conviction that would lead
to their present and eternal welfare.
They take the downward road. This is
very lamentable. Let all who call them-
selves Latter-day Saints walk in the path
that points to eternal life. I mourn and
lament when any of my brethren come
to me and confess that they have been
guilty of this or that crime, especially
when I learn that they have been in the
Church for years. We are yet subject
to sin, and more or less give way to it;
and in so doing we more or less dis-
grace the Priesthood and the high voca-
tion to which we are called. Latter-day
Saints should live their religion, as they
would that their neighbors should live
it. If I delight to see my brother walk in
the path of obedience, let me pursue the
same path, saying come, brethren and
sisters, walk as I walk, and follow Christ
as I follow him. Were this the case, but
few could be found who would raise their
voices against the kingdom of God upon
the earth.

To say that sin is necessary is an
unusual saying. Sin is in the world,
but it is not necessary that we should
sin, because sin is in the world; but,
to the contrary, it is necessary that


