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tasy of the Church. I do not believe for
one moment that there has been a man
or woman upon the face of the earth,
from the days of Adam to this day, who
has not been enlightened, instructed,
and taught by the revelations of Jesus
Christ. "What! the ignorant heathen?"
Yes, every human being who has pos-
sessed a sane mind. I am far from believ-
ing that the children of men have been
deprived of the privilege of receiving the
Spirit of the Lord to teach them right
from wrong. No matter what the tra-
ditions of their fathers were, those who
were honest before the Lord, and acted
uprightly, according to the best knowl-
edge they had, will have an opportunity
to go into the kingdom of God. I believe
this privilege belonged to the sons and
daughters of Adam, and descended from
him, and his children who were contem-
porary with him, throughout all genera-
tions.

Men who are under the influence of
their traditions and former notions, will
desire to ask scores of questions upon
this subject, but I think I can relieve
your minds.

The Spirit of the Lord, in teach-
ing the people, in opening their minds
to the principles of truth, does not in-
fringe upon the laws God has given to
mankind for their government; conse-
quently, when the Lord made man, He
made him an agent accountable to his
God, with liberty to act and to do as he
pleases, to a certain extent, in order to
prove himself. There is a law that gov-
erns man thus far; but the law of the
celestial kingdom, as I have frequently
told you, is, and always will be, the
same to all the children of Adam. When
we talk of the celestial law which is re-
vealed from heaven, that is, the Priest-
hood, we are talking about the principle
of salvation, a perfect system of govern-
ment, of laws and ordinances, by which
we can be prepared to pass from one
gate to another, and from one sentinel

to another, until we go into the presence
of our Father and God. This law has not
always been upon the earth; and in its
absence, other laws have been given to
the children of men for their improve-
ment, for their education, for their gov-
ernment, and to prove what they would
do when left to control themselves; and
what we now call tradition has grown
out of these circumstances.

There is so much of this, that I hardly
dare to commence talking about it. It
would require a lengthy discourse upon
this particular point. Suffice it to say,
the Lord has not established laws by
which I am compelled to have my shoes
made in a certain style. He has never
given a law to determine whether I shall
have a square-toed boot or a peaked-toed
boot; whether I shall have a coat with
the waist just under my arms, and the
skirts down to my heels; or whether I
shall have a coat like the one I have on.
Intelligence, to a certain extent, was be-
stowed both upon Saint and sinner, to
use independently, aside from whether
they have the law of the Priesthood or
not, or whether they have ever heard of it
or not. "I put into you intelligence," saith
the Lord, "that you may know how to
govern and control yourselves, and make
yourselves comfortable and happy on the
earth; and give unto you certain priv-
ileges to act upon as independently in
your sphere as I do in the government of
heaven."

No matter whether we are Jew or
Gentile, as the two classes of people are
called; though Gentile signifies disobedi-
ent people; no matter whether we believe
in the Koran as firmly as we now believe
in the Bible; no matter whether we have
been educated by the Jews, the Gentiles,
or the Hottentots; whether we serve the
true and the living God, or a lifeless im-
age, if we are honest before the God we
serve.


