
Israel; Therefore, when these works and 
the works which shall be wrought among 
you hereafter”—that is, the works which 
were performed during the first three or 
four centuries of the Christian era on the 
American continent, recorded in their re-
cords called the Book of Mormon—“when 
these works and the works which shall be 
wrought among you hereafter shall come 
forth from the Gentiles, unto your seed 
which shall dwindle in unbelief because of 
iniquity.”

Now this dwindling in unbelief of the 
American Indians is very evident even 
to the antiquarians of our country, all of 
whom will admit that once a civilized na-
tion dwelt on this continent. No learned 
man living disputes this. Why do they 
suppose any such thing? The ruins of 
their ancient cities, palaces and temples, 
proclaim in the ears of all living that once 
there dwelt on this hemisphere a great and 
powerful people, who were civilized and 
understood the art of constructing beau-
tiful and substantial buildings. But now, 
O! how degraded, fallen and sunk into the 
very depths of darkness are the descendants 
of that once great, powerful and exalted 
people! “They shall dwindle in unbelief 
because of iniquity;” because they rejected 
the Gospel. In the fourth century of the 
Christian era they apostatized from the 
religion of their fathers; they were cursed 
by the Almighty, a skin of darkness came 
upon them; they were cursed in all that 
they set their hands to do, and the wither-
ing curse of the Almighty has been upon 
them from generation to generation, until 
the present day. They were to dwindle in 
unbelief because of iniquity.

“For thus it behooveth the Father  
that it should come forth from the  
Genti les ,  that  he  may show forth

his power to the Gentiles, for this cause 
that the Gentiles, if they will not harden 
their hearts, that they may repent and 
come unto me and be baptized in my 
name and know of the truth of my doc-
trine, that they may be numbered among 
my people, O house of Israel.”

Such is the object of bringing this work 
forth to the Gentiles first. That is why God 
prepared the way for a great and powerful 
nation, free from all other nations under 
heaven, to be established here on this con-
tinent. The great purpose which God had 
in view was to set up a kingdom in the lat-
ter days in which there should be full and 
complete religious liberty and freedom of 
conscience, that the kingdom might go 
forth unto the ends of the earth; “And 
when these things shall come to pass that 
thy seed”—the American Indians—“shall 
begin to know these thing—it shall be a 
sign unto them, that they may know that 
the work of the Father hath already com-
menced unto the fulfilling of the covenant 
which he hath made unto the people who 
are of the house of Israel.”

Now then, here is a prediction in 
Isaiah, that before the Lord gathers Israel 
he would set up a sign, showing not 
only to us but to all people, nations and 
tongues in the four quarters of the earth 
that he is about to gather together all the 
people of the house of Israel. That sign is 
when these American Indians shall begin 
to know the Gospel taught and practiced 
by their ancient fathers. “When that day 
shall come, it shall come to pass that 
kings shall shut their mouths; for that 
which had not been told them shall they 
see; that which they had not heard shall 
they consider. For in that day, for my  
sake shall the Father work a work, which
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