
with redoubled force upon our minds, 
upon occasions like this. In honor to the 
great God we are here assembled. To the 
Valleys of the mountains we have been led 
by His Almighty power and watchful guid-
ance. We have been delivered from our en-
emies, from our oppressors, by His unerr-
ing wisdom, and surpassing kindness.

Never before could the Saints look 
around, and behold so glorious, so pros-
perous a prospect before them, for the ac-
complishment of the enterprise which we 
this day commence. Although peace may 
temporarily have smiled around, yet it was 
like the lone traveler, struggling to make 
his way through the scarcely incrustated 
lava, yet warm, amid the craters of the mo-
mentarily extinct volcano, which has only 
ceased to pour forth its liquid fire, to gather 
renewed and increased energy, and again 
send forth its lurid flame, molten fury, and 
devastation, to all around. Thus has it ever 
been with this people—in the midst of en-
emies have they struggled to build up cities, 
wherein they might inhabit; erect temples 
unto the name of the God whom they serve, 
wherein to worship, and receive their holy 
anointings and endowments. But no sooner 
have they commenced, than have also com-
menced the howlings of the myrmidons of 
Satan’s kingdom, crying, as they did before 
Pilate, when they murdered the Savior of 
the world, “Away with him! away with him! 
crucify him! crucify him!” And they have 
poured out their wrath—they have mur-
dered the Saints, driven them from city to 
city, from land to land, dispossessed them 
of their inheritances, destroyed their cities, 
their temples and slain their Prophets.

As it was in the days of our Savior and 
his Apostles, so has it been in our day. They 
have used every stratagem, every exertion 
to destroy the Priesthood from the face 
of the earth. They were successful then—

will they be so now? Will the author-
ity of the holy and eternal Priesthood of 
Almighty God, again be driven from the 
face of the earth, the Prophets and Apos-
tles all slain, and none left in possession 
of the living oracles of divine truth? No! 
No!! The might of Jehovah will preserve 
us. The Lord God will sustain us, and if 
so be, we should be scattered as hitherto, 
He will gather us in greater power, greater 
numbers, with increased ability to perform 
His work upon the earth.

Let all people, sinners, mobocrats, and 
devils, learn from experience that perse-
cution, plunder, robbery, rapine, murder, 
and expulsion from home and country, 
will not win. They have effectually tried 
this plan, and it has as effectually failed 
every time. Please take notice! And devise 
some new scheme the next time, wherein 
you can feel some assurance, that you may 
possibly succeed, and we have the pleasure 
of not being plundered, murdered, and 
disfranchised in the same old way. Tax 
your inventive genius for some broader 
scheme to destroy God’s people from the 
face of the earth.

Suppose you try the suggestion of our 
much esteemed, though distant, learned, 
very polite, and unsolicited chronicler, 
Lieutenant Gunnison, “of letting us alone se-
verely.” But I will not make suggestions for 
you, having great confidence in your ability 
of changing your mode of operation. When 
your plans become so futile, weak, and un-
availing, as to become stale and uninterest-
ing, I may suggest for you. In the meantime, 
let the Saints remember the promise Presi-
dent Young made them, upon the occasion 
of his breaking the ground for this temple, 
on the 14th of February last—“Not one of 
them, who had not been through the fiery 
ordeal, should lose the privilege, if he con-
tinued faithful; he shall not be a whit be-
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