
time, who can hold the keys of this mat-
ter; but one man has power to turn the key 
to inquire of the Lord, and to say whether 
I, or these my brethren, or any of the rest 
of this congregation, or the Saints upon 
the face of the whole earth, may have this 
blessing of Abraham conferred upon them; 
he holds the keys of these matters now, the 
same as Nathan, in his day.

But, says one, how have you obtained 
this information? By new revelation. 
When was it given, and to whom? It was 
given to our Prophet, Seer, and Revelator, 
Joseph Smith, on the 12th day of July, 
1843; only about eleven months before he 
was martyred for the testimony of Jesus.

He held the keys of these matters; he 
had the right to inquire of the Lord; and 
the Lord has set bounds and restrictions to 
these things; He has told us in that rev-
elation, that only one man can hold these 
keys upon the earth at the same time; and 
they belong to that man who stands at the 
head to preside over all the affairs of the 
Church and kingdom of God in the last 
days. They are the sealing keys of power, 
or in other words, of Elijah, having been 
committed and restored to the earth by 
Elijah, the Prophet, who held many keys, 
among which were the keys of sealing, to 
bind the hearts of the fathers to the chil-
dren, and the children to the fathers; to-
gether with all the other sealing keys and 
powers, pertaining to the last dispensation. 
They were committed by that Angel who 
administered in the Kirtland Temple, and 
spoke unto Joseph the Prophet, at the time 
of the endowments in that house.

Now, let us enquire, what will become of 
those individuals who have this law taught 
unto them in plainness, if they reject it? [A 
voice in the stand, “they will be damned.”] 
I will tell you: they will be damned,

saith the Lord God Almighty, in the rev-
elation He has given. Why? Because where 
much is given, much is required; where 
there is great knowledge unfolded for the 
exaltation, glory, and happiness of the 
sons and daughters of God, if they close 
up their hearts, if they reject the testimony 
of His word, and will not give heed to the 
principles He has ordained for their good, 
they are worthy of damnation, and the 
Lord has said they shall be damned. This 
was the word of the Lord to His servant 
Joseph the Prophet himself. With all the 
knowledge and light he had, he must com-
ply with it, or, says the Lord unto him, you 
shall be damned; and the same is true in 
regard to all those who reject these things.

What else have we heard from our 
President? He has related to us that there 
are some damnations that are eternal in 
their nature; while others are but for a cer-
tain period, they will have an end, they will 
not receive a restoration to their former 
privileges, but a deliverance from certain 
punishments: and instead of being restored 
to all the privileges pertaining to man pre-
vious to the fall, they will only be permit-
ted to enjoy a certain grade of happiness, 
not a full restoration. Let us inquire after 
those who are to be damned, admitting 
they will be redeemed, which they will be, 
unless they have sinned against the Holy 
Ghost. They will be redeemed, but what 
will it be to? Will it be to exaltation, and 
to a fulness of glory? Will it be to become 
the sons of God, or Gods to reign upon 
thrones, and multiply their posterity, and 
reign over them as kings? No, it will not. 
They have lost that exalted privilege for-
ever; though they may, after having been 
punished for long periods, escape by the 
skin of their teeth; but no kingdom will be 
conferred upon them. What will be their 
condition? I will tell you what revelation
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