
cipalities, and powers, in the eternal 
worlds; but we cannot get them out of 
their nests, to travel a few miles here. If 
they cannot do this, how will they ever 
learn to go from world to world?

We went, and were blessed in our jour-
neying. We had a pretty hard time in 
crossing the plains, and I should not rec-
ommend people to go so late in the sea-
son as we did. We should have lost all our 
horses, but the hand of God was over us 
for our good; He delivered us out of all our 
dangers, and took us through safely. When 
we got to the Missouri River, the ice was 
running very strong, so that it was impossi-
ble to ferry; but in one night the river froze 
over, and we passed over as on a bridge, in 
perfect safety; but as soon as the last team 
was over, the ice again removed. Thus the 
Lord favored us in our extremities.

You may inquire, how did you get 
along preaching? The best way that we 
could, the same as we always do. We went 
to work (at least I did) to try to learn the 
language a little. I went into the city of 
Boulogne, and I obtained permission there 
from the mayor to preach; this I was under 
the necessity of doing. At that time, I had 
not been very particular in seeking recom-
mends as I went along; but I had a recom-
mend from Governor Young: he told the 
folks I was an honorable man, and signed 
his name to it as the Governor of the 
Territory of Utah, and Willard Richards as 
Secretary. I told the mayor, in relation to 
these matters, I had not many papers with 
me, but I had one that I obtained from the 
Governor of the state I came from. “O,” 
says he, “Mr. Taylor, this is very good in-
deed, won’t you leave it with me, and if 
anybody finds any fault, I shall have it to 
refer to.”

Severa l  Protestant  pr ies t s  f rom 
England commenced to annoy us, and

wanted to create a disturbance in the meet-
ing, but I would not allow it, besides I was 
in a strange city, and was received courte-
ously by the mayor, and wished my meet-
ing to be orderly. These insolent men came 
to create disturbance in our meetings, 
but seeing they could not get a chance of 
speaking inside the doors, they followed 
me in the streets, asking me questions as I 
walked along. Among the questions, they 
said something about “Joe Smith.” Says I, 
“Who are you talking about? I was well ac-
quainted with Mr. Joseph Smith; he was a 
gentleman, and would not treat a stranger 
as you do me.” They still, however, dogged 
after me, asking me more questions. I told 
them, I did not wish to talk with men of 
their caste. They finally sent me a chal-
lenge, and we had a discussion; the result 
of it you may have read as published. The 
Methodist preacher denied his calling, and 
was to be removed from his place, in con-
sequence; and the others sunk into forget-
fulness—I could obtain no information 
of them when last there. I decreed, then, 
I would let the English alone, and turn to 
the French.

I went from there right into the city of 
Paris, and commenced translating the Book 
of Mormon, with brother Bolton to assist 
me. We baptized a few; some of them men 
of intelligence and education, and capable 
of assisting us in the work. Brother Pack 
went to Calais, and raised a small Church 
there. We afterwards united some English 
Branches, Boulogne en France, to it, called 
the Jersey Islands. There the people speak 
half English, half French; and brother Pack 
went to preside over them. Brother Bolton 
and I remained principally in Paris, and 
in that neighborhood; we there organized 
a Church. Before I came away, we held a 
Conference, at which four hundred mem-
bers were represented, including those
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